RULES AND REGULATIONS OF
THE SAFETY FIRE COMMISSIONER
CHAPTER 120-3-24 RULES AND REGULATIONS FOR

LOSS PREVENTION DUE TO COMBUSTIBLE DUST EXPLOSIONS AND FIRE

TABLE OF CONTENTS

120-3-24-.01 Promulgation and Purpose

120-3-24-.02 Application

120-3-24-.03 Definitions

120-3-24-.04 Registration of Industry and Manufacturing Processes and Compliance with Codes
and Standards Adopted.

120-3-24-.05 Fire Safety Information and Training to be Reported

120-3-24-.06 State Minimum Fire Safety Standards with Modifications

120-3-24-.07 Request for Modification of Specific Requirements

120-3-24-.08 Accessibility to and Use of Public Facilities by Persons with Disabilities

120-3-24-.09 Parking Space Designation for Persons with Disabilities

120-3-24-.10 Violation and Penalties

120-3-24-.11 Notes

120-3-24-.12 Sovereign immunity as to carrying out the provisions of this chapter; legal duties,
obligations, of property owners and lessees.

120-3-24-.13 Severability

120-3-24-.01 Promulgation and Purpose

(1) These rules and regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner entitled, “Rules and Regulations
for the State Minimum Fire Safety Standards for Loss Prevention Due to Combustible Dust Explosions and
Fire,” are promulgated as specified in the Official Code of Georgia Annotated, (O.C.G.A.) Section 25-2-4.

(2) The primary purpose of these rules and regulations is to establish the state minimum fire safety
standards for specific industry groups that have experienced either frequent combustible dust incidents or
combustible dust incidents with catastrophic consequences and prescribe technical requirements related to
building construction and to provide safety measures for operations to prevent and mitigate fires and dust
explosions in facilities that handle combustible particulate solids It further develops requirements for the
training of employees to assist them in identifying fire hazards, developing safety procedures, evacuation
plans, conducting safety drills and requires the reporting of manufacturing processes, incidents of fire,
employee training, the practice of and participation in fire safety and emergency evacuation drills.

Authority. - 0.C.G.A. §§25-2-4, 33-2-9, and 50-13-21.

120-3-24-.02

Application.

(1)(a) Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-4, rules and regulations adopted by the Safety Fire

Commissioner shall have the force and effect of law and shall have statewide application as being the state
minimum fire safety standards and shall not require adoption by a municipality or county. The governing
authority of any municipality or county in this state is authorized to enforce the state minimum fire safety
standards on all buildings and structures that have operations involving the manufacturing, processing,
and/or handling combustible particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create combustible
dust for those specific industry groups that have experienced either frequent combustible dust incidents or
combustible dust incidents with catastrophic consequences and are identify by the Standard Industrial
Classification (SIC) Code listed in (b) under this Rule. Regardless of enforcement by local governing
authorities, any business which that has under its control, facilities where the manufacturing, processing,
and/or handling combustible particulate solids are taking place shall comply with this Chapter including



those manufacturing processes that create combustible dust except as specified herein.

(b) For the purpose of this Chapter, operations involving the manufacturing, processing, and/or
handling combustible particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create combustible dust for
specific industry groups that have experienced either frequent combustible dust incidents or combustible
dust incidents with catastrophic consequences are as follows:

SIC NAICS Industries with either frequent or catastrophic combustible dust incidents:

2046 311221 Wet Corn Milling

4911 221112 Electric Services --Establishments engaged in the generation, transmission,
and/or distribution of electric energy for sale

2041 311211 Flour and Other Grain Mill Products

2493 321219 Reconstituted Wood Products

2899 325510, 325998 Chemicals and Chemical Preparations, Not Elsewhere Classified

2099 311212 Prepared foods and miscellaneous food specialties, not elsewhere classified

3471 332813 Electroplating, Plating, Polishing, Anodizing, and Coloring

3341 331314 Secondary Smelting and Refining of Nonferrous Metals

2834 325412 Pharmaceutical Preparations

2499 321920, 321219 Wood Products, Not Elsewhere Classified

2421 321113 Sawmills and Planing Mills, General

2062 311312 Cane Sugar Refining

2063 311313 Beet Sugar (Establishments primarily engaged in manufacturing sugar from
sugar beets.

3061 326291 Molded, Extruded, and Lathe-Cut Mechanical Rubber Goods

3714 336322 Motor Vehicle Parts and Accessories

3365 331524 Aluminum Foundries

723 115114, 115111 Crop Preparation Services for Market, Except Cotton Ginning

2052 311821 Fresh cookies, crackers, pretzels, and similar "dry" bakery products

2087 311930 Flavoring extracts, syrups, powders, and related products, not elsewhere
classified

2221 313210 Broadwoven Fabric Mills, Manmade Fiber and Silk

2262 313311 Finishers of Broadwoven Fabrics of Manmade Fiber and Silk

2299 313111 Textile Goods, Not Elsewhere Classified

2431 321911 Millwork

2434 33711 Wood Kitchen Cabinets

2439 321213, 321214 Structural Wood Members, Not Elsewhere Classified

2452 321992 Prefabricated Wood Buildings and Components

2511 337122 Wood Household Furniture, Except Upholstered

2591 337920 Drapery Hardware and Window Blinds and Shades

2819 325188, 325998, Industrial Inorganic Chemicals, Not Elsewhere Classified

331311

2821 325211 Plastic Materials, Synthetic Resins, and Nonvulcanizable Elastomers

2823 325221 Cellulosic Manmade Fibers

2841 325611 Soap and Other Detergents, Except Specialty Cleaners

2851 32551 Paints, Varnishes, Lacquers, Enamels, and Allied Products

2861 325191 Gum and Wood Chemicals

3011 326211 Tires and Inner Tubes

3069 326299 Fabricated Rubber Products, Not Elsewhere Classified

3081 326113 Unsupported Plastics Film and Sheet

3082 326121 Unsupported Plastics Profile Shapes

3086 326140, 326150 Plastics Foam Products

3087 325991 Custom Compounding of Purchased Plastics Resins

3089 326199 Plastics Products, Not Elsewhere Classified

3291 327910 Abrasive Products

3313 331312 Alumina and Aluminum Production and Processing

3334 331312 Primary Production of Aluminum



3354 331316 Aluminum Extruded Products

3363 331521 Aluminum Die-Castings

3369 331528 Nonferrous Foundries, Except Aluminum and Copper

3398 332811 Metal Heat Treating

3441 332431 Metal Cans

3469 332116 Metal Stampings, Not Elsewhere Classified

3479 332812 Coating, Engraving, and Allied Services, Not Elsewhere Classified

3496 332618 Miscellaneous Fabricated Wire Products

3499 332999 Fabricated Metal Products, Not Elsewhere Classified

3548 335129 Electric and Gas Welding and Soldering Equipment

3644 335932 Noncurrent-Carrying Wiring Devices

3761 336414 Guided Missiles and Space Vehicles

3799 333924 Transportation Equipment, Not Elsewhere Classified

3995 339995 Burial Caskets

3999 321999, 325998, Manufacturing Industries, Not Elsewhere Classified
326199

4221 493130 Farm product warehousing and storage

4952 221320 Sanitary treatment facilities.

4953 562920 Refuse Systems

5093 423930 Scrap and waste materials

5162 424610 Plastics materials and basic forms and shapes

(c) Notwithstanding paragraph (b), these regulations do not cover those operations and installation
governed by other specific regulations promulgated for specific processes and purposes specified in Title
25 of the Official Code of Georgia. These regulations are not applicable to any building or structure which
is used exclusively for agricultural purposes as defined in paragraph (4.1) of Code Section 1-3-3 of the
Official Code of Georgia and which is located in an unincorporated area. Furthermore, this regulation shall
not be applicable to any building or structure that is covered under the Federal regulations 29 CFR
1910.272, of the Occupational Safety and Health Administration entitled “Grain Handling Facilities.”

(d) The provisions of this Chapter reflect what is believed to be necessary to provide an acceptable
degree of protection from the hazards addressed by this Chapter and the standards adopted therein at the
time this Chapter was promulgated. Unless otherwise specified, the provisions of this Chapter or the
standards adopted herein, the adopted Codes and standards shall not apply to facilities, equipment,
structures, or installations that existed or were approved for construction prior to March 7, 2008.

() Any new construction modification or renovation shall comply with the new construction
provisions and operation provisions established within this Chapter and the standards adopted herein
whether such construction requires permitting or approval at the state or local level. Any modification or
renovation of existing equipment or any installation of new equipment or any new processes shall comply
with the new provisions established within this Chapter and the standards adopted herein whether such
modification, renovation of existing equipment or any installation of new equipment or any new processes
requires permitting or approval at the state or local level.

(f) This standard shall apply to facilities on which construction has begun and where specified in
the Codes and standards adopted herein, the provisions of such Code or standard shall be retroactive.

(9) The retroactive requirements of the Codes and standards adopted herein shall be permitted to
be modified if their application clearly would be impractical in the judgment of the authority having
jurisdiction, and only where it is clearly evident that a reasonable degree of safety is provided.

(h) Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-13(f), the municipal governing authority in any incorporated area
or the county governing authority in any unincorporated area of the state shall have the authority to enact
such ordinances as it deems necessary to perform fire safety inspections and related activities for those
buildings and structures not covered by O.C.G.A. 25-2-13 and are covered by this Chapter.



(2) Whenever the provisions of this chapter of the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire
Commissioner offer alternatives, as far as fire safety requirements are concerned, that were not permissible
under previous editions of any Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner covering the same
subject matter, the provisions of this chapter may be used by the authority having jurisdiction in
determining whether a building is in compliance with the provisions of O.C.G.A. Title 25, Chapter 2, and
the rules and regulations promulgated there under.

Authority. - 0.C.G.A. §§25-2-4, 25-2-13(b)(2), 25-2-13(b)(4)and 50-13-21.

120-3-24-.03 Definitions

(1) “Authority Having Jurisdiction.” shall mean for the purpose of this chapter, the organization,
office, or individual responsible for approving equipment, materials, an installation, or a procedure.

(2) “Building Official” shall mean for the purpose of this chapter, the officer or other designated
authority charged with the administration and enforcement of the International Building Code, or a duly
authorized representative.

(3) “Business” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter, any firm corporation, business, person,
partnership, organization, association, contractor, individual or other entity, engaged in manufacturing,
processing, and/or handling combustible particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create
combustible dust.

(4) “Combustible Dust” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter, any finely divided solid
material that is 420 microns or smaller in diameter (material passing a U.S. No. 420 microns or smaller in
diameter (material passing a U.S. No. 40 Standard Sieve) and presents a fire or explosion hazard when
dispensed and ignited in air. (From NFPA 654)

(5) “Combustible Particulate Solid” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter, any combustible
solid material, composed of distinct particles or pieces, regardless of size, shape, or chemical composition.
Combustible particulate solids include dusts, fibers, fines, chips, chunks, flakes, or mixtures of these.

(6) “Commissioner” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter, the Georgia Safety Fire
Commissioner or his/her designated representative.

(7) “Existing Building” shall mean for the purpose of this chapter, buildings, structures, facilities
or conditions which are already in existence or constructed and officially authorized prior to March 7,
2008. This definition shall apply to all situations covered by this chapter except where otherwise noted by
this chapter or as otherwise deemed a proposed building or structure as specified in Chapter 2 of Title 25.

(8) “Fire Chief” shall mean for the purpose of this chapter, the chief officer of the fire department
serving the jurisdiction, or a duly authorized representative.

(9) “Fire Official” shall mean for the purpose of this chapter, the fire chief or other designated
authority charged with the administration and enforcement of the codes and standards adopted herein, or a
duly authorized representative.

(10) “Fire Wall” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter and O.C.G.A. Code Sections 25-2-4
and 25-2-13, walls of any approved noncombustible materials and have sufficient structural stability under
fire conditions to allow collapse of construction on either side without collapse of the wall for the duration
of time indicated by the required fire-resistance rating.

(11) "Full Time Employee" shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter, an individual who works
for the firm and is on payroll for a minimum of thirty and one half hours of paid service per week, per
employer.



(12) “ICC Code”, shall mean, for the purposes of the Safety Fire Commissioner’s Rules and
Regulations, any of the codes, or portions thereof, as published by the International Code Council (ICC)
and as adopted and modified as set forth in this Chapter or any other chapter of the Safety Fire
Commissioner’s Rules and Regulations.

(13) “Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS)” shall mean for the purpose of this chapter, a form
containing data regarding the properties of a particular substance. An important component of product
stewardship and workplace safety, it is intended to provide workers and emergency personnel with
procedures for handling or working with that substance in a safe manner, and includes information such as
physical data (melting point, boiling point, flash point, etc.), toxicity, health effects, first aid, reactivity,
storage, disposal, protective equipment, and spill handling procedures. The exact format of an MSDS can
vary from source to source.

(14) “NFPA Code or Standard” shall mean, for the purposes of the Safety Fire Commissioner’s
Rules and Regulations, any of the codes and /or standards, or portions thereof, as published by the National
Fire Protection Association (NFPA) and as adopted and modified in this chapter or any other chapter of the
Safety Fire Commissioner’s Rules and Regulations.

(15) “Occupied Story” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter and the codes and standards
adopted herein, a story subject to be by people on a regular basis. Stories used exclusively for mechanical
equipment rooms, elevator penthouses and similar spaces are not occupiable stories.

(16) “Primary Level of Exit Discharge” shall mean, for the purpose of this chapter that story
which is level with or above finished grade by more than 50% of the cubic volume of the occupiable story.
Building levels below the primary level shall not count as a story in determining the height of a building.

(17) “Stories” shall mean, for the purpose of O.C.G.A. Section 25-2-13 (b)(1) and the codes and
standards adopted herein, that level starting at the primary level of exit discharge and ending at the highest
occupiable story. A building level below the primary level shall not count as a story in determining the
height of a building.

Authority. - 0.C.G.A. §§25-2-4, 33-2-9, and 50-13-21.

120-3-24-.04 Registration of Industry and Manufacturing Processes and Compliance with Codes
and Standards Adopted.

(1) All new and existing facilities that have operations involving the manufacturing, processing,
and/or handling combustible particulate solids shall register by electronic means with the Commissioner
including any industry that has manufacturing processes which create combustible dust. So as to allow for
an orderly implementation of the on line data registration and reporting system, entities are directed to the
following link http://www.gainsurance.org/safetymfg/home.aspx to determine exact registration and
reporting dates for industries of concern. The particular industry will be identified by posting the SIC
Codes (Standard Industrial Classification Codes) that appear in a company's disseminated EDGAR filings
(the Electronic Data Gathering, Analysis, and Retrieval system) that indicates the company's type of
business. The posting will provide a minimum of 30 days notice prior to the due date of their first
electronic report. Such notification will begin no later than July 1, 2010. Each facility of the industry type
posted for the notification for registering and reporting shall use the same link;
http://www.gainsurance.org/safetymfg/home.aspx to complete the registration process and file any
additional data or report required to be filed that has been deemed necessary by the Commissioner to ensure
compliance with these rules and regulations.




(a) Registration shall indicate the following regarding the individual industry facility and information shall
be kept current:

Industry Information Geo Code Location
Facility Name: Latitude:
Physical Address: Street, City, Zip code Longitude:
Mailing Address: Street, City, Zip code County:

Main Telephone Number Census Tract:

SIC and NAICS Codes Census Block:

(b) Registration shall indicate the following regarding the individual whom management has
designated to be responsible for filing electronic reports as required by this Chapter. This individual shall
be known as the “Authorized Agent” and contact information for the Authorized Agent shall be kept
current:

Authorized Agent

Contact name:

Telephone Number:

E-mail Address:

(c) Other information deemed necessary by the Commissioner which may include but is not limited
to emergency information, equipment type, possible ignition sources, process/industry type corporate and
physical facility information.

(2) Material safety data sheets for products being processed or used during the manufacturing
process shall be kept on file and readily available and accessible upon request and/or in the event of an
emergency and shall contain all pertinent data regarding the properties of the particular substances involved
in the manufacturing process. Such data sheets shall provide information for workers and emergency
personnel on procedures for handling or working with that substance in a safe manner, and shall includes
information such as physical data (melting point, boiling point, flash point, etc.), toxicity, health effects,
first aid, reactivity, storage, disposal, protective equipment, and spill handling procedures. All material
safety data sheets on file shall be made current anytime there is an update, addition, or modification to
existing material safety data sheets or when there are changes in the materials being process, stored, or
handled.

(3) Detailed information shall be recorded and kept on file anytime changes occur in the
operation process, new equipment is introduced, changes occur in existing equipment, and/or changes
occur in the materials being processed, stored, or handled. This information shall be readily available and
accessible upon request and/or in the event of an emergency.

(4) In addition, all operations of manufacturing, processing, and/or handling combustible
particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create combustible dust covered under this
Chapter shall comply with the provisions specified herein with the exclusion of the existing building
construction as specified. Any new construction modification or renovation shall comply with the new
construction provisions and operation provisions established within this Chapter and the standards adopted
herein whether such construction requires permitting or approval at the state or local level. Any
modification or renovation of existing equipment or any installation of new equipment or any new
processes shall comply with the new provisions established within this Chapter and the standards adopted
herein whether such modification, renovation of existing equipment or any installation of new equipment or
any new processes requires permitting or approval at the state or local level.

Authority. - O.C.G.A. §§25-2-4, 25-2-39, 33-2-9, and 50-13-21.



120-3-24-.05 Fire Safety Information and Training to be Reported

(1) Management responsible for employee’s safety shall designate an individual to be responsible
for filing electronic reports as required by this Chapter. This individual shall be known as the “Authorized
Agent” and contact information for the Authorized Agent shall be kept current.

(2) Designated individual shall electronically report on an annual basis that the following required
items have been addressed and completed where applicable:

Initial training for new employees

Annual refresher training for employees

Emergency plans have been developed, reviewed and updated
Monthly notification of hazards is provided to employees
Emergency response team training

Emergency response team drills

(3) Verification by written affidavit certifying annually that the required emergency plans, drills,
training and monthly notifications have been completed for the past calendar year will be required to be
uploaded.

Authority. - O.C.G.A. §§25-2-4, 33-2-9, and 50-13-21.

120-3-24-.06 State Minimum Fire Safety Standards with Modifications.

(1) Unless otherwise stated in this chapter, the edition of the International Fire Code (IFC), and
the following editions of the codes, standards, recommended practices, guides and methods, as published in
the National Fire Codes (NFC) by the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA), as adopted and
modified in this Chapter, shall be herein established as the state minimum fire safety standards for all
buildings and structures that have operations involving the manufacturing, processing, and/or handling
combustible particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create combustible dust. Where any
of the adopted publications of the NFPA references NFPA 1 or NFPA 5000, it shall be construed that such
references apply to the International Fire Code (IFC) or the International Building Code (IBC)
respectively, as adopted by this Chapter, Chapter 120-3-3 and the Georgia Department of Community
Affairs. Where the IFC or IBC does not specifically address the referenced issue, NFPA 1 or NFPA 5000
may be applied subject to the approval of the authority having jurisdiction.

(2) International Fire Code (IFC), 2006 Edition
Modifications:

(a) Modifications to Chapter 1:

1. Delete section 101.1 in its entirety an substitute in its place the following:

“101.1 Title. The International Fire Code, 2006 edition, published by the International Code
Council, when used in conjunction with this Chapter, shall be known as a Georgia State Minimum Fire
Prevention Code, hereafter referred to as “this code”.”

2. Delete section 101.3 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“101.3 Purpose and intent. The primary purpose of this Code, as adopted, is to provide, along
with other adopted codes and standards, for the reasonable minimum protection of life and property from
the hazards created by fire, smoke, explosion, or panic created from a fear of fire or smoke. It is intended
that the purposes of this Code be accomplished by: (1) Coordinating application and enforcement of its
provisions with those of other applicable laws, rules, regulations, codes, and standards; and, (2) By
coordinating the application of its provisions, where possible, with educational programs or efforts
designed to bring about changes in high risk attitudes and behaviors that are the root causes of most fire
related problems in Georgia; and (3) By encouraging or requiring informational and awareness programs



designed to make the citizens of Georgia aware of their responsibilities for compliance with this Code as
well as the other Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner. The intent of this Code is to
establish the minimum requirements, consistent with nationally recognized good practice, for providing a
reasonable level of life safety and property protection from the hazards of fire, explosion, or dangerous
conditions in new and existing buildings, structures, and premises and to provide safety to fire fighters and
emergency responders during emergency operations.”

3. Add an exception to section 102.1 to read as follows:

“Exception: This Code does not apply to one- and two- family dwellings or one- and two- family
row houses (townhouses) separated by a 2-hour fire wall containing not more than three dwelling units per
structure.”

4. Add an exception to section 102.2 to read as follows:

“Exception: This Code does not apply to one- and two- family dwellings or one- and two- family
row houses (townhouses) separated by a 2-hour fire wall containing not more than three dwelling units per
structure.”

5. Delete section 102.3 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“102.3 Change of use or occupancy. No change shall be made in use or occupancy of any
building or structure that would place the structure in a different division of the same group or occupancy
or in a different group of occupancies, unless such structure is made to comply with the requirements of
this Code, as may be applicable, as well as those of the International Building Code (IBC), as adopted by
the Department of Community Affairs. Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-14, due to a change of use or occupancy
of a building or structure the building or structure shall be treated as a proposed (new) building. (Refer to
103.3 of this Code regarding the requirements applicable to proposed (new) buildings and structures.)”

6. Delete section 102.4 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“102.4 Application of the building code. The design and construction of proposed (new)
buildings and structures shall comply with the International Building Code (IBC), as modified and adopted
by the Georgia Department of Community Affairs. Repairs, alterations, additions, changes in use of
occupancy classification, or changes in buildings or structures required by provisions of the IFC, and which
are within the scope of the IBC, shall be made in accordance with the IBC, for purposes of this Chapter.”

7. Delete section 102.5 in its entirety and insert in its place the following:

“102.5 Historic Buildings. Refer to 102.1 and 102.2 regarding the application of this Code to
existing buildings. Except to the extent required by applicable laws of Georgia, the provisions of this Code
are not mandatory for buildings or structures identified and classified by the state, or as appropriate, a local
jurisdiction, as historic buildings when such buildings or structures are judged by the fire code official to be
safe and in the public interest of health, safety and welfare. When evaluating the safety of historic buildings
the fire official should consult O.C.G.A. Title 8, Chapter2 Article 3 entitled, ‘Uniform Act for the
Application of Building and Fire Related Codes to Existing Buildings,” and the provisions of O.C.G.A.
Sections 25-2-13 (b)(3) & 25-2-13(b)(4), and NFPA Standard 914, Code for Fire Protection of Historic
Structures, as adopted by this Chapter as a recommended practice.”

8. Delete section 102.6 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“102.6 Referenced codes and standards. Where the provisions of this Code or the standards
referenced thereby and in Chapter 45 of this Code do not apply to the specific subjects, situations or
conditions encountered that involve risks to life and property from the hazards of fire, panic from fear of
fire or smoke, or related hazards, compliance with the applicable chapters of the Rules and Regulations of
the Safety Fire Commissioner shall be evidence of compliance with this Code.”

9. Add a new section 102.10 to read as follows:

“102.10 Coordination of provisions. This Code shall apply to all buildings, structures and
facilities as provided in subsections 102.1 and 102.2, and shall be utilized in conjunction with codes and
standards specified in Table 102.10 entitled, “CODES REFERENCE GUIDE.



Table 102.10: CODES REFERENCE GUIDE

Area Primary Supplement

Occupancy Classification

Building Construction Types Including allowable
height, allowable building areas, and the
requirements for sprinkler protection related to
minimum building construction types.

Means of Egress LSC NONE
Standpipes IBC IFC

Interior Finish LSC NONE
HVAC Systems IMC NONE
Vertical Openings LSC NONE

IBC LSC

Sprinkler Systems minimum construction standard LSC NONE

Fire Alarm Systems LSC NONE

Smoke Alarms and Smoke Detection Systems State Statute NONE
and LSC

Portable Fire Extinguishers IFC NONE

. . LSC and
Cooking Equipment NFPA 96 NONE

Fuel Fired Appliances IFGC NFPA 54
Liquid Petroleum Gas NFPA 58 NFPA 54 or IFGC

Compressed Natural Gas NFPA 52 NONE

10. Delete section 103 and all sections there under in their entirety and substitute in its place the
following:

“SECTION 103

GENERAL PROVISIONS FOR EXISTING AND PROPOSED (NEW) BUILDINGS.”

103.1 General Provisions. The administration, enforcement and penalty provisions of O.C.G.A.
Title 25, Chapter 2, and the administrative provisions of the various chapters of the Rules and Regulations
of the Safety Fire Commissioner shall apply to and regulate the application and enforcement of this Code
by the Safety Fire Division of the Office of the Safety Fire Commissioner.

NOTE: Nothing herein shall be construed as prohibiting any local jurisdiction from adopting the
deleted portions of Chapter 1 of this Code for local purposes, provided, however, local amendments shall
not be less restrictive than this Code, and other codes and standards as adopted by the various chapters of
the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner.

103.1.1 The provisions of O.C.G.A. Title 25, Chapter 2, and other applicable state laws, and the
applicable provisions of various chapters of the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner
regarding the requirements for certificates, licenses, permits, plan reviews, inspections, approvals, fees, etc.
shall apply and are in addition to any requirements of local jurisdictions. Local authorities having
jurisdiction need to be consulted to determine if rules and regulations of the local jurisdiction regarding the
requirements for local certificates, licenses, permits, plan reviews, inspections, approvals, fees, etc. also
apply.

103.1.1.1 The administrative, operational, and maintenance provisions of this Code, with regard
to the Safety Fire Division of the Office of the Georgia Safety Fire Commissioner, shall be limited to the
scope and intents and purposes of the Official Code of Georgia Annotated (O.C.G.A.) Title 25, Chapter 2,
and the Commissioner’s Rules and Regulations.



103.1.1.1.1 Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-13(d), every person who owns or controls the use of any
building, part of a building, or structure described in O.C.G.A 25-2-13 (b)(1), which because of floor area,
height, location, use or intended use as a gathering place for large groups, or use or intended use by or for
the aged, the ill, the incompetent, or the imprisoned, constitutes a special hazard to property or to the life
and safety on account of fire or panic from fear of fire, must so construct, equip, maintain, and use such
building or structure as to afford every reasonable and practical precaution and protection against injury
from such hazards. No person who owns or controls the use or occupancy of such a building or structure
shall permit the use of the premises so controlled for any such specially hazardous use unless he has
provided such precautions against damage to property or injury to persons by these hazards as are found
and determined by the Commissioner in the manner described in O.C.G.A. 25-2-13(d) to be reasonable and
practical.

103.2 Existing buildings. Every building and structure existing as of April 1, 1968, which
building or structure is listed in paragraph (1) of subsection (b) of O.C.G.A 25-2-13 shall comply with the
minimum fire safety standards in the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner promulgated
pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2 which were in effect at the time such building or structure was constructed.

Exception 1: Any nonconformance noted under the electrical standards adopted at the time such
building or structure was constructed shall be corrected in accordance with the current electrical standards
adopted pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2.

Exception 2: A less restrictive provision contained in any subsequently adopted minimum fire
safety standard pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2, may be applied to any existing building or structure.

103.2.1 Existing buildings to be deemed a proposed building. For the purposes of O.C.G.A.
25-2-14(b), any existing building or structure listed in paragraph (1) of subsection (b) of O.C.G.A. 25-2-13
and which comes under the jurisdiction of the Office of the Safety Fire Commissioner, pursuant to
0.C.G.A. 25-2-12, shall be deemed to be a proposed (new) building in the event such building or structure
is subject to substantial renovation, a fire or other hazard of serious consequence, or a change in the
classification of occupancy. The term “substantial renovation”, for purposes of this subsection means any
construction project involving exits or internal features of such building or structure costing more than the
building’s or structure’s assessed value according to county tax records at the time of such renovation
(0.C.G.A. 25-2-14). Where a change of classification is involved, also refer to 102.3 of this Code.

103.3 Proposed (new) buildings and additions to existing buildings:

103.3.1 Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-14.1(b), every proposed building and structure listed in
paragraph (1) of subsection (b) of O.C.G.A. 25-2-13 shall comply with the adopted minimum fire safety
standards that were in effect on the date that plans and specifications therefore were received by the state
fire marshal, the proper local fire marshal, or state inspector for review and approval.

103.3.2 Plans and specifications for all proposed buildings which come under classification in
paragraph (1) of subsection (b) of O.C.G.A. 25-2-13 and which come under the jurisdiction of the Office of
the Safety Fire Commissioner pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-12 shall be submitted to and receive approval by
either the state fire marshal, the proper local fire marshal, or state inspector before any state, municipal, or
county building permit may be issued or construction started (O.C.G.A. 25-2-14(a)). All such plans and
specifications submitted as required by O.C.G.A. 25-2-14(a) shall be accompanied by a fee in the amount
provided in O.C.G.A. 25-2-4.1 and shall bear the seal and Georgia registration number of the drafting
architect or engineer or shall otherwise have the approval of the Commissioner.

103.3.3 Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-37(a), it shall be unlawful for any person to begin construction
on any proposed building or structure which comes under the classification in paragraph (1) of subsection
(b) of O.C.G.A 25-2-13 and which comes under the jurisdiction of the Office of the Safety Fire
Commissioner pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-12 without first having plans approved in accordance with
0.C.G.A. 25-2-14.

103.4 Proposed building construction and completion. Pursuant to O.0.G.A. 25-2-14(b), a
complete set of plans and specifications approved as set forth in 103..3 shall be maintained on the
construction site, and construction shall proceed in compliance with the state minimum fire safety standards
under which such plans and specifications were approved. The owner of any such building or structure or
his authorized representative shall notify the state fire marshal, the proper local fire marshal, or state
inspector upon completion of approximately 80 percent of the construction thereof and shall apply for a
certificate of occupancy when construction of such building or structure is completed.

103.5 Certificate of occupancy required. Pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-2-14(c), every building or
structure which comes under classification in paragraph (1) of subsection (b) of O.C.G.A. 25-2-13 and

10



which comes under the jurisdiction of the Office of the Safety Fire Commissioner pursuant to O.C.G.A. 25-
2-12 shall have a certificate of occupancy issued by the state fire marshal, the proper local fire marshal, or
state inspector before such building or structure may be occupied. Such certificates of occupancy shall be
issued for each business establishment within the building, shall carry a charge in the amount provided in
0.C.G.A. 25-2-4.1, shall state the occupant load for such business establishment or building, shall be
posted in a prominent location within such business establishment or building, and shall run for the life of
the building, except as provided in O.C.G.A. 25-2-14(d). (See 103.2.1of the IFC, as adopted by this
Chapter.)”

11. The provisions of section 105, PERMITS, are not adopted for purposes of this Chapter. Local
governing authorities may adopt the provisions for local purposes. Refer to section 103.3 with regard to
permits required by the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner.

12. Delete section 107.6 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“107.6 Overcrowding and Life Safety Hazards. Overcrowding or admittance of any person
beyond the approved capacity of a building or a portion thereof shall not be allowed. The Fire Code
Official, upon finding any overcrowded conditions or obstructions in aisles, passageways or other means of
egress, or upon finding any condition which constitutes a life safety hazard, shall be authorized to cause the
event to be stopped until such condition or obstruction is corrected. A structure, building, individual room
or designated portion thereof shall be deemed to be overcrowded if the number of occupants exceeds one
person per 5 sq. ft. of open net floor area of such room or space when fixed seating is not provided. In
addition, a structure, building, room or designated portion thereof shall be deemed overcrowded if the total
number of occupants exceeds the exit capacity of the structure, building, room or area involved.”

13. The provisions of section 108, BOARD OF APPEALS, are not adopted for purposes this
Chapter. Local governing authorities may adopt the provisions for local purposes.

14. Delete section 109.3 and all sections there under in their entirety and substitute in its place the
following:

“109.3 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation
of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate
used under provisions of this Code, shall be guilty of violation of Code Section 25-2-37 of the Official
Code of Georgia Annotated. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense.

109.3.1 Abatement of violation. In addition to the imposition of the penalties herein described,
the fire code official is authorized to institute appropriate action to prevent unlawful construction or to
restrain, correct or abate a violation; or to prevent illegal occupancy of a structure or premises; or to stop an
illegal act, conduct of business or occupancy of a structure on or about any premises.”

(b) Modifications to Chapter 2:

1. Delete section 201.3 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not defined in this Code and are defined
in the International Building Code (IBC), the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), the International
Mechanical Code (IMC), or codes and standards of the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA), as
adopted by this Chapter and other the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner, such terms
shall have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes and standards.”

2. Add the following definitions to section 202:
“Day-care Center - A day-care facility subject to licensure or commission by the Department of

Human Resources where more than 12 clients receive care.”

“Group Day-care Home - A day-care facility subject to licensure or commission by the
Department of Human Resources where at least seven but not more than 12 clients receive care.”

11



“Personal Care Home/Assisted Living Facility - Any building or part thereof that is used for the
lodging or boarding of residents, not related by blood or marriage to the owners or operators, for the
purpose of providing personal care services and licensed as a personal care home or assisted living
facility.”

“Residential Occupancies. Occupancies, as specified in the scope of this standard, include the
following, as defined in Chapter 2 of this Code, or the IBC, or by State law, or by the Rules and
Regulations of the Georgia Safety Fire Commissioner: (1) Apartment buildings, (2) Lodging and rooming
houses, (3) Board and care facilities, (4) Hotels, motels, and dormitories, (5) Personal care homes and
assisted living facilities , (6) Day-care centers and group day-care homes.”

(c) Modifications to Chapter 3:

1. Delete section 303.5 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“303.5 Fire Extinguishers. There shall be at least one portable fire extinguisher complying with
Section 906 and with a minimum 2-A:40-B:C rating within 25 feet (7620 mm) of each asphalt (tar) kettle
during the period such kettle is being utilized, and a minimum of one additional portable fire extinguisher
with a minimum 3-A:40-B:C rating on the roof being covered.”

2. Add new exceptions 4, 5, 6, 7 and 8 to section 308.3.7 to read as follows:

“4.  In Group A public assembly occupancies having an occupant load greater than 300, a
minimum ceiling height of 25 feet and that are protected throughout by an approved, supervised automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13, as adopted by this Chapter, pyrotechnic special
effect devices shall be permitted to be used on stages before proximate audiences for ceremonial or
religious purposes, as part of a demonstration in exhibits, or as part of a performance, provided that
precautions satisfactory to the authority having jurisdiction are taken to prevent ignition of any combustible
material and use of the pyrotechnic device complies with NFPA 1126, Standard for the Use of
Pyrotechnics before a Proximate Audience, as adopted by Chapter 120-3-22 Rules and Regulations of the
Safety Fire Commissioner. The ceiling height may be lowered to a minimum of 15 feet upon approval of
the authority having jurisdiction having witnessed a demonstration shot of all types of devices being used
in the display.

5. In Group A public assembly occupancies having an occupant load greater than 300, a minimum
ceiling height of 25 feet and that are protected throughout by an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with NFPA 13, as adopted by this Chapter, flame effects before an audience
shall be permitted in accordance with NFPA 160, Standard for Flame Effects Before an Audience, as
adopted by Chapter 120-3-22 Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner. The ceiling height
may be lowered to a minimum of 15 feet upon approval of the authority having jurisdiction having
witnessed a demonstration of all types of devices being used in the display.

6. On stages and platforms as a necessary part of a performance in public assembly occupancies
having an occupant load greater than 300, a minimum ceiling height of 25 feet and that are protected
throughout by an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13,
as adopted by this Chapter. The ceiling height may be lowered to a minimum of 15 feet upon approval of
the authority having jurisdiction having witnessed a demonstration of all types of devices being used in the
display.

7. In Group A public assembly occupancies having an occupant load greater than 100 with fixed
seating, a minimum ceiling height of 25 feet and that have a minimum of two certified fire fighters on site
with proper fire fighting equipment as determined by the local fire official, pyrotechnic special effect
devices shall be permitted to be used on stages before proximate audiences for ceremonial or religious
purposes, as part of a demonstration in exhibits, or as part of a performance, provided that precautions
satisfactory to the authority having jurisdiction are taken to prevent ignition of any combustible material
and use of the pyrotechnic device complies with NFPA 1126, Standard for the Use of Pyrotechnics before
a Proximate Audience, as adopted by Chapter 120-3-22 Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire
Commissioner. The ceiling height may be lowered to a minimum of 15 feet upon approval of the authority
having jurisdiction having witnessed a demonstration shot of all types of devices being used in the display.

8. In public assembly occupancies having an occupant load greater than 100 with fixed seating, a
minimum ceiling height of 25 feet and that have a minimum of two certified fire fighters on site with

12



proper fire fighting equipment as determined by the local fire official, flame effects before an audience
shall be permitted in accordance with NFPA 160, Standard for Flame Effects Before an Audience, as
adopted by this Chapter. The ceiling height may be lowered to a minimum of 15 feet upon approval of the
authority having jurisdiction having witnessed a demonstration of all types of devices being used in the
display.”

3. Add a new section 308.7 to read as follows:

“308.7 Portable Cooking Equipment. Portable cooking equipment that is not flue-connected
shall be permitted only as follows:

(1) Equipment fueled by small heat sources that can be readily extinguished by water, such as
candles or alcohol-burning equipment, including solid alcohol, shall be permitted to be used, provided that
precautions satisfactory to the authority having jurisdiction are taken to prevent ignition of any combustible
materials.

(2) Candles shall be permitted to be used on tables used for food service where securely supported
on substantial noncombustible bases located to avoid danger of ignition of combustible materials and only
where approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

(3) Candle flames shall be protected.

(4) “Flaming sword” or other equipment involving open flames and flamed dishes, such as
cherries jubilee or crépe suzette, shall be permitted to be used, provided that precautions subject to the
approval of the authority having jurisdiction are taken.

(5) Listed and approved LP-Gas commercial food service appliances shall be permitted to be used
where in accordance with NFPA 58, Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code.”

4. Delete section 310.1 and all sections there under in their entirety and substitute in its place the
following:

“310.1 General. The smoking or carrying of a lighted pipe, cigar, cigarette or any other type of
smoking paraphernalia or material is prohibited in buildings, structures, or areas, or portions of buildings,
structures, or areas , as indicated is this section, or in any other section of this Code or in any other code or
standard, as adopted by the Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner.”

5. Add a new section 316 to read as follows:

“SECTION 316 LABORATORIES,

316.1 General. Laboratories in which chemicals are used shall comply with NFPA 45, as adopted
by this Chapter.

Exception: Laboratories in I-2 (healthcare) occupancies and in medical and dental offices, shall
comply with NFPA 99, as adopted by this Chapter.”

(d) Modifications to Chapter 4:

1. Add a new paragraph 4 and renumber the remaining paragraphs in section 404.2 to read as
follows:

“404.2 Where required. An approved fire safety and evacuation plan shall be prepared and
maintained for the following occupancies and buildings.

1. Group A, other than Group A occupancies used exclusively for purposes of religious worship
that have an occupant load less than 2,000.

2. Group B buildings having an occupant load of 500 or more persons or more than 100 persons
above or below the lowest level of exit discharge.

3. Group E.
. Group F.
. Group H.
. Group L.
. Group R-1.
. Group R-2 college and university buildings.
. Group R-4.
10. High-rise buildings.
11. Group M buildings having an occupant load of 500 or more persons or more than 100 persons

O 0 3O\ L K~

13



above or below the lowest level of exit discharge.
12. Covered malls exceeding 50,000 square feet (4645 m2) in aggregate floor area.
13. Underground buildings.
14. Buildings with an atrium and having an occupancy in Group A, E or M.”

2. Delete section 405 and all sections there under in their entirety and substitute in its place the
following:

“SECTION 405
EMERGENCY EVACUATION DRILLS
405.1 General. Emergency evacuation drills complying with the provisions of this section shall be
conducted at least annually in the occupancies listed in Section 404.2 or when required by the fire code
official. Drills shall be designed in cooperation with the local authorities.
405.2 Frequency. Required emergency evacuation drills shall be held at the intervals specified in Table
405.2 or more frequently where necessary to familiarize all occupants with the drill procedure.
405.3 Leadership. Responsibility for the planning and conduct of drills shall be assigned to competent
persons designated to exercise leadership.
405.4 Time. Drills shall be held at unexpected times and under varying conditions to simulate the unusual
conditions that occur in case of fire.
405.5 Record keeping. Records shall be maintained on site and available for inspection by the Fire Code
Official of all required emergency evacuation drills for three years. Such records shall include the
following information:

1. Identity of the person conducting the drill.
2. Date and time of the drill.
3. Notification method used.
4. Staff members on duty and participating.
5. Number of occupants evacuated.
6. Special conditions simulated.
7. Problems encountered.
8. Weather conditions when occupants were evacuated.
9. Time required to accomplish complete evacuation.
Records of drills conducted shall be maintained
TABLE 405.2
FIRE AND EVACUATION DRILL
FREQUENCY AND PARTICIPATION
GROUP OROCCUPANCY FREQUENCY PARTICIPATION
Group A Quarterly Employees
Group Bc Annually Employees
Group Ee Monthlya All occupants
Group F & H Annually on each shift Employees
Group | Quarterly on each shift Employeesb
Group R-1 Quarterly on each shift Employees
Group R-24 Four annually All occupants
Group R-4 Quarterly on each shift Employeesb
High-rise buildings Annually Employees

a. The frequency shall be allowed to be modified in accordance with Section 408.3.2.

b. Fire and evacuation drills in residential care assisted living facilities shall include complete evacuation of the premises in
accordance with Section

408.10.5. Where occupants receive habilitation or rehabilitation training, fire prevention and fire safety practices shall be included as
part of the training program.

¢. Group B buildings having an occupant load of 500 or more persons or more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level of
exit discharge.

d. Applicable to Group R-2 college and university buildings in accordance with Section 408.3.

e. Drills shall be reported electronically to the Office of the Safety Fire Commissioner

405.6 Notification. Where required by the fire code official, prior notification of emergency evacuation
drills shall be given to the fire code official.

14



405.7 Initiation. Where a fire alarm system is provided, emergency evacuation drills shall be initiated by
activating the fire alarm system.

405.8 Accountability. As building occupants arrive at the assembly point, efforts shall be made to
determine if all occupants have been successfully evacuated or have been accounted for.

405.9 Recall and reentry. An electrically or mechanically operated signal used to recall occupants after an
evacuation shall be separate and distinct from the signal used to initiate the evacuation. The recall signal
initiation means shall be manually operated and under the control of the person in charge of the premises or
the official in charge of the incident. No one shall reenter the premises until authorized to do so by the
official in charge.”

3. Add an exception to section 406.2 to read as follows:

“Exception: Child care-giver training. A minimum of five hours initial fire safety training and
recommendation for receipt of a certificate of merit for successful completion of the training shall be
required for all directors, operators and all staff members of day-care centers and group day-care homes as
defined by the Life Safety Code adopted by this Chapter. The curriculum for the fire safety training shall
receive written approval by the State Fire Marshal’s Office and be taught by an instructor registered with
the Safety Fire Commissioner’s Office. All staff members shall receive this training within 90 days from
receipt of a license, being commissioned or the opening of a new center or home. Any new staff member
shall receive a minimum of five hours initial fire safety training and recommendation for receipt of a
certificate of merit for successful completion of the training within 90 days of employment. In addition, a
minimum of two hours fire safety refresher training recommendation for receipt of a certificate of merit for
successful completion of the training shall be required for all directors, operators and all staff members of
day-care centers and group day-care homes every three years from the date initial training is received. The
curriculum for the fire safety refresher training shall receive written approval by the State Fire Marshal’s
Office and be taught by an instructor registered with the Safety Fire Commissioner’s Office.”

4. Add new sections 408.2.3 and 408.2.3.1 to read as follows:

408.2.3 Crowd Managers. Assembly occupancies having occupant loads of 100 or more shall
be provided with a minimum of one trained crowd manager or crowd manager supervisor. Where the
occupant load exceeds 250, additional trained crowd managers or crowd manager supervisors shall be
provided at a ratio of 1:250, crowd manager / supervisor to occupants, respectively, unless otherwise
permitted by the following:

(1) This requirement shall not apply to assembly occupancies used exclusively for religious

worship with an occupant load not exceeding 2000.

(2) With the exception of assembly occupancies noted above where alcoholic beverages are
consumed, the ratio of trained crowd managers to occupants shall be permitted to be reduced
where, in the opinion of the authority having jurisdiction, the existence of an approved,
supervised sprinkler system and the nature of the event warrant.

408.2.3.1 The crowd manager shall receive approved training in crowd management techniques.”

5. Delete sections 408.4 through 408.11 all sections there under in their entirety and substitute in
their place the following:

“408.4 Group F occupancies. Group F occupancies shall comply with the requirements of
Sections 408.4.1 through 408.4.4 and Sections 401 through 407.
408.4.1 Plans and diagrams. In addition to the requirements of Section 404 and Section 407.6, plans and
diagrams shall be maintained in approved locations indicating any hazardous areas within the facility and
locations of exits.
408.4.2 Plan updating. The plans and diagrams required by Section 408.4.1 shall be maintained up to date
and the fire code official and fire department shall be informed of all major changes.
408.4.3 Emergency response team. Responsible persons shall be designated as the on-site emergency
response team and trained to be liaison personnel for the fire department. These persons shall aid the fire
department in preplanning emergency responses, identifying hazardous locations and be familiar with the
chemical nature of any hazardous material stored on site. An adequate number of personnel for each work
shift shall be designated.
408.4.3.1 Disaster training. Malfunctions of the process should be simulated and emergency actions
undertaken. Disaster drills that simulate a major catastrophic situation should be undertaken periodically

15



with the cooperation and participation of public fire, police, and other local community emergency units
nearby cooperating plants if involved.
408.4.4 Employee Training. The requirements of Sections 408.4.4.1 thru 408.4.6 shall be for new
employees and shall be also be applied retroactively with a completion date of January 1, 2011, for existing
employees.
408.4.4.1 Initial Training. Initial training shall be provided to employees and contractors who are involved
in operating, maintaining, and supervising facilities that handle combustible particulate solids. Initial
training shall ensure that all employees are knowledgeable about the following:

(1) Hazards of their workplace

(2) General orientation, including plant safety rules

(3) Process description

(4) Equipment operation, safe startup and shutdown, and response to upset conditions

(5) The necessity for proper functioning of related fire and explosion protection systems

(6) Equipment maintenance requirements and practices

(7) Housekeeping requirements

(8) Emergency response plans
408.4.4.2 Refresher Training. Emergency plans and procedures, including information that is covered in
Section 408.4.4.1, shall be provided to and reviewed annually by all employees and contractors who are
involved in operating, maintaining, and supervising facilities that handle combustible particulate solids.
408.4.5 Notification of Hazards. Notification of hazards shall be by means of internal written or electronic
correspondence, postings of information at conspicuous locations and/or by other means to disseminate
information to employees to ensure they are knowledgeable about the hazards of their workplace. Required
notifications shall include such topics as prescribed in 408.4.4.1.
408.4.5.1 Notification Frequency. All employees shall receive monthly notification of hazards and safety
information related to the industry’s operation.
408.4.6 Certification. For those industries having operations involving the manufacturing, processing,
and/or handling combustible particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create combustible
dust listed under Rule 120-3-24-.021(b), the employer’s authorized agent shall electronically file to the
Safety Fire Commissioner a written affidavit certifying annually that the training and monthly notifications
required by Section 408.4.4.1 have been completed for the past calendar year.
408.4.7 Emergency drills. Emergency drills of the on-site emergency response team shall be conducted on
a regular basis but not less than once annually. Records of drills conducted shall be maintained on site and
available for inspection by the Fire Code Official.
408.5 Group H occupancies. Group H occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.5.1 through 408.5.4 and Sections 401 through 407.
408.5.1 Plans and diagrams. In addition to the requirements of Section 404 and Section 407.6, plans and
diagrams shall be maintained in approved locations indicating the approximate plan for each area, the
amount and type of HPM stored, handled and used, locations of shutoff valves for HPM supply piping,
emergency telephone locations and locations of exits.
408.5.2 Plan updating. The plans and diagrams required by Section 408.5.1 shall be maintained up to date
and the fire code official and fire department shall be informed of all major changes.
408.5.3 Emergency response team. Responsible persons shall be designated as the on-site emergency
response team and trained to be liaison personnel for the fire department. These persons shall aid the fire
department in preplanning emergency responses, identifying locations where HPM is stored, handled and
used, and be familiar with the chemical nature of such material. An adequate number of personnel for each
work shift shall be designated.
408.5.3.1 Disaster training. Malfunctions of the process should be simulated and emergency actions
undertaken. Disaster drills that simulate a major catastrophic situation should be undertaken periodically
with the cooperation and participation of public fire, police, and other local community emergency units
nearby cooperating plants if involved.
408.5.4 Employee Training. The requirements of Sections 408.5.4.1 thru 408.5.6 shall be for new
employees and shall be also be applied retroactively with a completion date of January 1, 2011, for
currently existing employees.
408.5.4.1 Initial Training. Initial training shall be provided to employees who are involved in operating,
maintaining, and supervising facilities that handle combustible particulate solids. Initial training shall
ensure that all employees are knowledgeable about the following:

16



(1) Hazards of their workplace

(2) General orientation, including plant safety rules

(3) Process description

(4) Equipment operation, safe startup and shutdown, and response to upset conditions

(5) The necessity for proper functioning of related fire and explosion protection systems

(6) Equipment maintenance requirements and practices

(7) Housekeeping requirements

(8) Emergency response plans
408.5.5 Notification of Hazards. All employees shall receive monthly notification of hazards and safety
information related to the industry’s operation.
408.5.5.1 Notification Frequency. Notification of hazards shall be by means of internal written or
electronic correspondence, postings of information at conspicuous locations and/or by other means to
disseminate information to employees to ensure they are knowledgeable about the hazards of their
workplace. Monthly notifications can include such topics as prescribed in 408.5.4.1.
408.5.6 Certification. For those industries having operations involving the manufacturing, processing,
and/or handling combustible particulate solids including manufacturing processes that create combustible
dust listed under Rule 120-3-24-.021(b), the employer’s authorized agent shall electronically file to the
Safety Fire Commissioner a written affidavit certifying annually that the training and monthly notifications
required by Section 408.5.4.1 have been completed for the past calendar year.
408.5.7 Emergency drills. Emergency drills of the on-site emergency response team shall be conducted on
a regular basis but not less than once every three months. Records of drills conducted shall be maintained
and available for inspection by the Fire Code Official.
408.6 Group I-1 occupancies. Group I-1 occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.6.1 through 408.6.5 and Sections 401 through 406.
408.6.1 Fire safety and evacuation plan. The fire safety and evacuation plan required by Section 404 shall
include special staff actions including fire protection procedures necessary for residents and shall be
amended or revised upon admission of any resident with unusual needs.
408.6.2 Staff training. Employees shall be periodically instructed and kept informed of their duties and
responsibilities under the plan. Such instruction shall be reviewed by the staff at least every two months. A
copy of the plan shall be readily available at all times within the facility.
408.6.3 Resident training. Residents capable of assisting in their own evacuation shall be trained in the
proper actions to take in the event of a fire. The training shall include actions to take if the primary escape
route is blocked. Where the resident is given rehabilitation or habilitation training, training in fire
prevention and actions to take in the event of a fire shall be a part of the rehabilitation training program.
Residents shall be trained to assist each other in case of fire to the extent their physical and mental abilities
permit them to do so without additional personal risk.
408.6.4 Drill frequency. Emergency evacuation drills shall be conducted at least six times per year, two
times per year on each shift. Twelve drills shall be conducted in the first year of operation. Drills are not
required to comply with the time requirements of Section 405.4.
408.6.5 Resident participation. Emergency evacuation drills shall involve the actual evacuation of
residents to a selected assembly point.
Exception: Actual exiting from windows shall not be required. Where a drill scenario includes the escape
from windows, Opening the window and signaling for assistance shall be acceptable.
408.7 Group I-2 occupancies. Group I-2 occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.7.1 and 408.7.2 and Sections 401 through 406. Drills are not required to comply with the time
requirements of Section 405.4.
408.7.1 Evacuation not required. During emergency evacuation drills, the movement of patients to safe
areas or to the exterior of the building is not required.
408.7.2 Coded alarm signal. When emergency evacuation drills are conducted after visiting hours or when
patients or residents are expected to be asleep, a coded announcement is allowed instead of audible alarms.
408.8 Group 1-3 occupancies. Group I-3 occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.8.1 through 408.8.4 and Sections 401 through 406.
408.8.1 Employee training. Employees shall be instructed in the proper use of portable fire extinguishers
and other manual fire suppression equipment. Training of new staff shall be provided promptly upon
entrance on duty. Refresher training shall be provided at least annually.

17



408.8.2 Staffing. Group I-3 occupancies shall be provided with 24-hour staffing. Staff shall be within three
floors or 300 feet (91 440 mm) horizontal distance of the access door of each resident housing area. In Use
Conditions 3, 4 and 5, as defined in Chapter 2, the arrangement shall be such that the staff involved can
start release of locks necessary for emergency evacuation or rescue and initiate other necessary emergency
actions within 2 minutes of an alarm.

Exception: Staff shall not be required to be within three floors or 300 feet (9144 mm) in areas in which all
locks are unlocked remotely and automatically in accordance with Section 408.4 of the International
Building Code.

408.8.3 Notification. Provisions shall be made for residents in Use Conditions 3, 4 and 5, as defined in
Chapter 2, to readily notify staff of an emergency.

408.8.4 Keys. Keys necessary for unlocking doors installed in a means of egress shall be individually
identifiable by both touch and sight.

408.9 Group R-1 occupancies. Group R-1 occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.8.1 through 408.8.3 and Sections 401 through 406.

408.9.1 Evacuation diagrams. A diagram depicting two evacuation routes shall be posted on or
immediately adjacent to every required egress door from each hotel, motel or dormitory sleeping unit.
408.9.2 Emergency duties. Upon discovery of a fire or suspected fire, hotel, motel and dormitory
employees shall perform the following duties:

1. Activate the fire alarm system, where provided.

2. Notify the public fire department.

3. Take other action as previously instructed.

408.9.3 Fire safety and evacuation instructions. Information shall be provided in the fire safety and
evacuation plan required by Section 404 to allow guests to decide whether to evacuate to the outside,
evacuate to an area of refuge, remain in place, or any combination of the three.

408.10 Group R-2 occupancies. Group R-2 occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.10.1 through 408.10.3 and Sections 401 through 406.

408.10.1 Emergency guide. A fire emergency guide shall be provided which describes the location,
function and use of fire protection equipment and appliances accessible to residents, including fire alarm
systems, smoke alarms, and portable fire extinguishers. The guide shall also include an emergency
evacuation plan for each dwelling unit.

408.10.2 Maintenance. Emergency guides shall be reviewed and approved in accordance with Section
401.2.

408.10.3 Distribution. A copy of the emergency guide shall be given to each tenant prior to initial
occupancy.

408.11 Group R-4 occupancies. Group R-4 occupancies shall comply with the requirements of Sections
408.11.1 through 408.11.5 and Sections 401 through 406.

408.11.1 Fire safety and evacuation plan. The fire safety and evacuation plan required by Section 404
shall include special staff actions, including fire protection procedures necessary for residents, and shall be
amended or revised upon admission of a resident with unusual needs.

408.11.2 Staff training. Employees shall be periodically instructed and kept informed of their duties and
responsibilities under the plan. Such instruction shall be reviewed by the staff at least every two months. A
copy of the plan shall be readily available at all times within the facility.

408.11.3 Resident training. Residents capable of assisting in their own evacuation shall be trained in the
proper actions to take in the event of a fire. The training shall include actions to take if the primary escape
route is blocked. Where the resident is given rehabilitation or habilitation training, training in fire
prevention and actions to take in the event of a fire shall be a part of the rehabilitation training program.
Residents shall be trained to assist each other in case of fire to the extent their physical and mental abilities
permit them to do so without additional personal risk.

408.11.4 Drill frequency. Emergency evacuation drills shall be conducted a total of six times per year, two
of which occur twice a year on each shift. Twelve drills shall be conducted in the first year of operation.
Drills are not required to comply with the time requirements of Section 405.4.

408.11.5 Resident participation. Emergency evacuation drills shall involve the actual evacuation of
residents to a selected assembly point and shall provide residents with experience in exiting through all
required exits. All required exits shall be used during emergency evacuation drills.

Exception: Actual exiting from windows shall not be required. Opening the window and signaling for help
shall be an acceptable alternative.

18



408.12 Covered mall buildings. Covered mall buildings shall comply with the provisions of Sections
408.12.1 through 408.12.3.

408.12.1 Lease plan. A lease plan shall be prepared for each covered mall building. The plan shall include
the following information in addition to that required by Section 404.3.2:

1. Each occupancy, including identification of tenant.

2. Exits from each tenant space.

3. Fire protection features, including the following:

3.1. Fire department connections.

3.2. Fire command center.

3.3. Smoke management system controls.

3.4. Elevators and elevator controls.

3.5. Hose valves outlets.

3.6. Sprinkler and standpipe control valves.

3.7. Automatic fire-extinguishing system areas.

3.8. Automatic fire detector zones.

3.9. Fire barriers.

408.12.1.1 Approval. The lease plan shall be submitted to the fire code official for approval, and shall be
maintained on site for immediate reference by responding fire service personnel.

408.12.1.2 Revisions. The lease plans shall be revised annually or as often as necessary to keep them
current. Modifications or changes in tenants or occupancies shall not be made without prior approval of the
fire code official and building official.

408.12.2 Tenant identification. Each occupied tenant space provided with a secondary exit to the exterior
or exit corridor shall be provided with tenant identification by business name and/or address. Letters and
numbers shall be posted on the corridor side of the door, be plainly legible and shall contrast with their
background.

Exception: Tenant identification is not required for anchor stores.

408.12.3 Maintenance. Unoccupied tenant spaces shall be:

1. Kept free from the storage of any materials.

2. Separated from the remainder of the building by partitions of at least 0.5-inch-thick (12.7 mm) gypsum
board or an approved equivalent to the underside of the ceiling of the adjoining tenant spaces.

3. Without doors or other access openings other than one door that shall be kept key locked in the closed
position except during that time when opened for inspection.

4. Kept free from combustible waste and be broom swept clean.”

(e) Modifications to Chapter 5:

1. Add a new section 501.5 to read as follows:

“501.5 Where buildings or facilities fall under the jurisdiction of the Georgia Safety Fire
Commissioner as set forth in the Official Code of Georgia Annotated (O.C.G.A.), Title 25, Chapter 2,
except for State owned facilities, it is intended that the provisions of Chapter 5 that primarily relate to fire
department response, access to facilities, access to building interiors, key boxes, premises identification,
fire department connection locations, and fire hydrant locations be administered by the local Fire Chief
and/or Fire Code Official responsible for providing fire or other emergency response to the buildings or
facilities. With regard to State owned facilities, that are not provided with a facility fire department, it is
intended that the local Fire Chief and/or Fire Code Official have input in the planning of facilities with
regard to the noted provisions covered by Chapter 5.”

2. Delete section 503.1.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be provided for
every facility, building or portion of a building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the
jurisdiction as determined by the local Fire Chief and/or Fire Code Official of the responding fire
department or agency. The fire apparatus access road shall comply with the requirements of this section and
shall extend to within 150 feet (45.7 m) of all portions of the facility or any portion of the exterior wall of
the first story of the building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the building or
facility.”

“Exception: The local Fire Chief and/or Fire Code Official of the responding fire department or

19



agency is authorized to increase the dimension of 150 feet (45.7 m) where:

“1. The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed
in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.

“2. Fire apparatus access roads cannot be installed because of location on property,
topography, waterways, nonnegotiable grades or other similar conditions, and an approved
alternative means of fire protection is provided.

“3. There are not more than two Group R-3 or Group U occupancies.”

3. Add a new section 504.1.1 to read as follows:

“504.1.1 Access Doors. For fire fighting purposes, there shall be at least one access door in each
100 linear feet (30.5 m) or major fraction thereof of the exterior walls which face the access roadways
required by Section 503, unless otherwise required in this code section. In exterior walls designed with
continuous rolling dock doors, which face access roadways, there shall be at least one access door in each
200 linear feet (61 m) or fraction thereof. Required access doors shall be a minimum of 3 feet (0.9 m) wide
and 6 feet 8 inches (2 m) high and shall be accessible without use of a ladder. Rolling doors are acceptable
for such purposes in buildings protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system(s) unless
otherwise approved for unsprinklered buildings by the local Fire Chief and /or Fire Code Official.”

4. Delete section 508.5.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“508.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or
moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 500 feet (152 m) from a hydrant on a fire apparatus
access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire
hydrant mains shall be provided where required by the local Fire Chief and /or Fire Code Official of the
responding fire department or agency.

“Exceptions:

“1. For group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet (183
m).

“2. For buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
(183 m).”

(f) Modifications to Chapter 6:

1. Add a new section 601.3 to read as follows:
“601.3 Where reference is made in this Code to the International Electrical Code, it shall be
construed as referencing NFPA 70, National Electrical Code (NEC) as adopted by this Chapter.”

2. Delete section 603.1.4 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“603.1.4 Fuel Oil. The grade of fuel oil used in a burner shall be that for which the burner is
approved and as stipulated by the manufacturer. The use of crankcase oil or any other oil containing
gasoline shall not be used except as permitted in NFPA 31, Standard for the Installation of Oil-Burning
Equipment, as adopted by Chapter 120-3-11, Rules and Regulations of the Safety Fire Commissioner.”

3. Delete section 603.4 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following. Section 603.4.1

remains unchanged.

“603.4 Portable heaters. Liquefied petroleum gas fuel fired, or liquid fuel fired space heating

devices designed to be portable are prohibited in all portions of occupancies in Groups A, E, F, I, R-1, R-2,
R-3 and R-4.

Exceptions:

1. In emergency conditions, when approved by the authority having jurisdiction, equipment
designed to be portable may be used for a specified time provided such equipment is properly
protected and separated from combustibles as specified by the manufacturer’s instructions and
the authority having jurisdiction.

2. Listed and approved unvented fuel-fired heaters in one- and two- family dwellings and
portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances used outside one- and two-family dwellings.

3. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances are allowed in accordance with Section

20



603.4.2.”

4. Add a new section 603.4.2 to read as follows:
603.4.2 Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances. Portable gas-fired heating appliances
located outdoors shall be in accordance with Sections 603.4.2.1 through 603.4.2.3.4.
603.4.2.1 Location. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances shall be located in accordance
with Sections 603.4.2.1.1 through 603.4.2.1.4.
603.4.2.1.1 Prohibited locations. The storage or use of portable outdoor gas-fired heating
appliances is prohibited where any of the following exist:
1. Inside any occupancy when connected to the fuel gas container.
2. Inside tents, canopies and membrane structures.
3. On exterior balconies in accordance with NFPA 58.
603.4.2.1.2 Clearance to buildings. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances shall be located
at least 5 feet from buildings.
603.4.2.1.3 Clearance to combustible materials. No portion of portable outdoor gas-fired
heating appliances shall be located beneath, or closer than 5 feet to combustible overhangs, awnings,
sunshades or similar combustible attachments buildings and combustible decorations.
603.4.2.1.4 Proximity to exits. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances shall not be located
within 10 feet of exits or exit discharges.
603.4.2.2 Installation and operation. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances shall be
installed and operated in accordance with Sections 603.4.2.2.1 through 603.4.2.2.4.
603.4.2.2.1 Listing and approval. Only listed and approved heating appliances utilizing a fuel
gas container that is integral to the appliance shall be used.
603.4.2.2.2 Installation and maintenance. Portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances shall be
installed and maintained in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions.
603.4.2.2.3 Tip-over switch. Portable gas-fired heating appliances shall be equipped with a tilt or
tip-over switch that automatically shuts off the flow of gas if the appliance is tilted more than 15 degrees
from vertical.
603.4.2.2.4 Guard against contact. The heating element or combustion chamber shall be
permanently guarded so as to prevent accidental contact by persons or material.
603.4.2.3 Gas containers. Fuel gas containers for portable outdoor gas-fired heating appliances
shall comply with Sections 603.4.2.3.1 through 603.4.2.3.4.
603.4.2.3.1 Approved containers. Only approved U.S. DOT or ASME gas containers shall be
used.
603.4.2.3.2 Container replacement. Replacement of gas containers in the heating appliance shall
not be conducted while the public is present.
603.4.2.3.3 Container capacity. The maximum individual capacity of gas containers used in
connection with portable gas-fired heating appliances shall not exceed 20 pounds.
603.4.2.3.4 Indoor storage prohibited. Gas containers shall not be stored inside of buildings
except in accordance with Section 3809.9.”

5. Delete section 605.10 and substitute in its place the following: Sections 605.10.1 through
605.10.4 remain unchanged.

“605.10 Portable, electric space heaters. Portable, electric heaters are prohibited in all portions
of occupancies in Groups A, E, F, R-1, R-2, and R-4. Where permitted, portable electric space heaters shall
comply with Sections 605.10.1 through 605.10.4.”

6. Add a new section 605.11 to read as follows:

“605.11 Separation from Transformers. Space separation for transformers shall be as follows:

“(1) Transformer pad locations shall be a minimum of 10 feet (3 m) from any building, building
overhangs, canopies, exterior walls, balconies, exterior stairs and/or walkways connected to the building.

“(2) Transformer pad edges shall be not less than 14 feet (4.3 m) from any doorway.

“(3) Transformer pad edges shall be not less than 10 feet (3 m) from any window or other opening.

“(4) If the building has an overhang, the 10 foot (3 m) clearance shall be measured from a point
below the edge of the overhang only if the building is three stories or less. If the building is four stories or
more, the 10 foot (3 m) clearance shall be measured from the outside building wall.

21



“(5) Fire escapes, outside stairs, and covered walkways attached to or between buildings, shall be
considered as part of the building.

“Exception No. 1: For (1), transformer pads may be located closer to noncombustible walls than
the above required minimum clearances upon written approval of the authority having jurisdiction,
however, in no case shall the transformer location be less then 3 feet (0.9 m) from the building.

“Exception No. 2: Transformer pads existing prior to December 31, 1994, are exempted from this
requirement. When buildings are modified, reductions in space separations may be less than the above
required minimum clearances upon written approval of the authority having jurisdiction.”

7. Delete sections 609.1 and 609.2 in their entirety and substitute in their place the following:

“609.1General. Commercial kitchen exhaust hoods and residential cooking appliances in
commercial and public buildings shall comply with the requirements of NFPA 96, Standard for Ventilation
Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations, as adopted by this Chapter

8. Delete section 609.2 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“609.2 Where required. A commercial hood complying with NFPA 96 shall be installed at or
above all commercial cooking appliances and domestic cooking appliances used for commercial purposes
that produce grease laden vapors.

Exception: Except as provided for in the scoping provisions subsection 1.1.4 of NFPA 96 as
adopted by this Chapter.”

(9) Modifications to Chapter 7:

1. Add a new section 703.5 to read as follows:

“703.5 Barrier ldentification. All fire and/or smoke barriers or walls shall be effectively and
permanently identified with signs or stenciling above a decorative ceiling and/or in concealed spaces with
letters a minimum of 2 inches (51 mm) high on a contrasting background spaced a maximum of 12 feet (3.7
m) on center with a minimum of one per wall or barrier. The hourly rating shall be included on all rated
barriers or walls. Suggested wording ‘(__) Hour Fire and Smoke Barrier-Protect All Openings.’

“Exception: Existing stenciling acceptable to the authority having jurisdiction.”

2. Delete section 704.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“704.1 Enclosures. The provisions of NFPA 101 as adopted by this Chapter shall govern the
enclosures requirements of vertical shafts, including but not limited to stairways and service and utility
shafts. (Refer to Table 102.10, CODES REFERENCE GUIDE)”

3. Delete Table 704.1 in its entirety.

4. Delete section 704.2 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“704.2 Opening protectives. The provisions of NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, as adopted by this
Chapter, shall govern the protection of openings in fire rated enclosures and barriers, including the self-
closing or automatic closing of opening protectives.”

(h) Modifications to Chapter 8:

1. Delete section 801.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“SECTION 801 GENERAL, 801.1 Scope. The provisions of NFPA 101, Life Safety Code, as
adopted by this Chapter, shall govern interior finish and interior trim in proposed (new) and existing
buildings. Sections 805, 806, 807, and 808 of this Code shall govern decorative vegetation, decorative
materials other than decorative vegetation, and furniture and furnishings in proposed (new) and existing
buildings. (Refer to Table 102.10, CODES REFERENCE GUIDE)”

(i) Modifications to Chapter 9:

1. Delete section 901.4.2 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

22



“901.4.2 Provisions in excess of the minimum Code requirements shall, as a minimum, be
installed to meet the provisions of the currently adopted code(s) and/or standard(s) which may be
applicable to the provision at the time of its installation. Any non-required fire protection system which is
added onto, or interconnected with, any required fire protection system (of a similar type), shall be
designed, installed, and maintained in accordance with the provisions of the currently adopted code(s)
and/or standard(s) which may be applicable to the provision at the time of its installation.

“Exceptions:

“l. Other installations not conforming with the provisions of the currently adopted code(s)
and/or standard(s) applicable to the provision at the time of its installation if such
installations are reported and filed with the local responding fire department and the
authority having jurisdiction. In addition such systems shall be identified as required by the
authority having jurisdiction.

“2. Non-required systems designed, reviewed, installed and approved in accordance with local
codes and/or ordinances.”

2. Add a new section 901.6.3 to read as follows:

“901.6.3 Automatic sprinkler systems and other water based fire extinguishing systems, including
fire pumps, required or installed, shall be maintained in accordance with NFPA 25, Standard for the
Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, adopted by this Chapter. A
certificate of inspection, as specified by NFPA 25, shall be retained on file at the facility and shall be made
available to the Fire Code Official upon request for review for a period of at least three years.”

3. Delete section 901.7.2 and substitute in its place the following:

“901.7.2 Tag Required. (a) A tag shall be used to indicate that a system, or portion thereof, has
been removed from service.

(b) For water based fire protection systems the tagging provisions of NFPA 25, Standard for the
Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, as adopted by this shall

apply.”

4.Delete section 903.2 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“903.2 Where required. (a) Approved automatic sprinkler systems for proposed (new) and
existing buildings and structures shall be installed as required by the applicable provisions of NFPA 101,
Life Safety Code, as adopted by this Chapter, provided, however, the International Building Code shall
govern the requirements for sprinkler protection that is related to minimum building construction types.
(Refer to Table 102.10, CODES REFERENCE GUIDE) In addition, an automatic sprinkler system may
be required by other NFPA standards adopted by this Chapter or other Rules and Regulations of the Safety
Fire Commissioner.”

Exception: Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings used exclusively for
telecommunications equipment, associated electrical power distribution equipment, batteries and standby
engines, provided those spaces or areas are equipped throughout with a supervised automatic fire alarm
system, and are separated from the remainder of the building by fire barriers consisting of walls and floor /
ceiling assemblies having a fire resistance rating of not less than 2-hours.

NOTE: NFPA 76, Recommended Practice for the Fire Protection of Telecommunications Facilities,
should be consulted. Refer to the edition adopted as a recommended practice by this Chapter.”

5. Add a new section 903.2.1 to read as follows:

“903.2.1 The requirements for the installation, design, and testing of automatic sprinkler systems
shall be as applicable, NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, NFPA 13D, Standard
for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, or
NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to and
Including Four Stories in Height, as adopted and modified by this Chapter.”

6. Delete section 904.2.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“904.2.1 Commercial hood and duct systems. Each required commercial kitchen exhaust hood
and duct system required by Section 610 to have a commercial hood complying with NFPA 96 shall be
protected with an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system installed in accordance with this code.”

23



7. Delete section 904.11 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“904.11 Fire Protection for Cooking Operations.”

“904.11.1 The requirements for as well as the design, installation, protection and maintenance of
cooking equipment, shall be as required by NFPA 101, Life Safety Code and NFPA 96, Standard for the
Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations, as adopted by this Chapter.”
(Refer to Table 102.10, CODES REFERENCE GUIDE)”

“904.11.2 Fire suppression systems approved for the protection of commercial cooking equipment
shall be designed, installed, and maintained in accordance with the applicable standards adopted in this
Chapter.”

8. Delete section 905.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“905.1General. The State's minimum requirements for standpipe systems shall be as required by
this Code, and the International Building Code. Standpipe systems shall be designed, installed and tested
in accordance with NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe, and Hose Systems as adopted by
this Chapter. (Refer to Table 102.10, CODE REFERENCE GUIDE”

9. Delete section 906.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“906.1 Portable Fire Extinguishers - General. Portable fire extinguishers shall be installed in
all buildings, structures and facilities falling under this Code and O.C.G.A. 25-2. For any other building,
structure, facility, or condition or special hazard, portable fire extinguishers shall be provided as may be
required by this Code in Table 906.1, or by various codes and standards adopted by this Chapter. (Refer to
Table 102.10, CODES REFERENCE GUIDE).”

10. Delete section 906.2 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“906.2 General requirements. The selection, distribution, installation, and maintenance of
portable fire extinguishers shall comply with NFPA 10, Standard for Portable Fire Extinguishers, as
adopted by this Chapter.

Exceptions:

“l. The maximum travel distance to reach an extinguisher shall not apply to the spectator seating

portions of Group A-5 occupancies.”

2. Thirty-day inspections shall not be required and maintenance shall be allowed to be once every
three years for dry-chemical or halogenated agent portable fire extinguishers that are supervised by a listed
and approved electronic monitoring device, provided that all of the following conditions are met:

(a) Electronic monitoring shall confirm that extinguishers are properly positioned,
properly charged and unobstructed.

(b) Loss of power or circuit continuity to the electronic monitoring device shall initiate a
trouble signal.

(c) The extinguishers shall be installed inside of a building or cabinet in a noncorrosive
environment.

(d) Electronic monitoring devices and supervisory circuits shall be tested every three
years when extinguisher maintenance is performed.

(e) A written log of required hydrostatic test dates for extinguishers shall be maintained
by the owner to ensure that hydrostatic tests are conducted at the frequency required by NFPA 10.

3. In Group E occupancies, in lieu of locating fire extinguishers in corridors and normal paths of
travel as specified in NFPA 10, Standard for Portable Fire Extinguishers, fire extinguishers may be located
in rooms that open directly onto such corridors and pathways provided all of the following are met:

(a) The room in which such extinguishers are placed are located in close proximity to that
portion of the corridor where a fire extinguisher would otherwise be placed in accordance
with NFPA 10; Standard for Portable Fire Extinguishers,

(b) A sign which states in white letters at least one inch in height on a red background,
‘FIRE EXTINGUISHER LOCATED IN THIS ROOM,,’ is placed on the corridor wall
immediately adjacent to the entrance way of each such room so that it can be clearly seen
at all times;

(c) The rooms in which such extinguishers are placed shall be constantly supervised
during school hours; and,

24



(d) Those rooms cannot be subject to being locked at any time the building is occupied.”

11. Delete section 906.9 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“906.9 Height above floor. Portable fire extinguishers having a gross weight not exceeding 40
pounds (18 kg) shall be installed so that its top is not more than 54 inches and not less than 48 inches above
the floor. Hand-held portable fire extinguishers having a gross weight exceeding 40 pounds (18 kg) shall be
installed so that its top is mot more than 3.5 feet (1067 mm) above the floor. The clearance between the
floor and the bottom of installed hand-held extinguishers shall not be less than 4 inches (102mm).”

12. Delete section 907.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following, while retaining
existing subsections:

“907.1 Fire Alarm Systems - General. The State's minimum requirements for fire alarm systems
shall be as required by NFPA 101, Life Safety Code as adopted by this Chapter. Fire alarm systems shall be
installed, tested, and maintained in accordance with NFPA 72, National Fire Alarm Code, as adopted by
this Chapter.”

13. Delete sections 907.2 through 907.16 in their entirety and without substitution.

14. Delete section 909.1 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“909.1 Scope and purpose. This section applies to mechanical or passive smoke control systems
when they are required for proposed (new) buildings or portions thereof by provisions of the Life Safety
Code (LSC) or this Code, as adopted by this Chapter, or by provisions of the International Building Code
(IBC), as adopted by the Department of Community Affairs, The purpose of this section is to establish
minimum requirements for the design, installation, and acceptance testing of smoke control systems that
are intended to provide a tenable environment for the evacuation or relocation of occupants. These
provisions are not intended for the preservation of contents, the timely restoration of operations, or for
assistance in fire suppression or overhaul activities. Smoke control systems regulated by this section serve a
different purpose than the smoke- and heat- venting provisions found in Section 910. Mechanical smoke
control systems shall not be considered exhaust systems under Chapter 5 of the International Mechanical
Code (IMC).”

15. Delete section 909.2 in its entirety and substitute in its place the following:

“909.2 General design requirements. Buildings, structures, or portions thereof required by
provisions of the Life Safety Code (LSC) or this Code, as adopted by this Chapter, or by provisions of the
International Building Code, as adopted by the Department of Community Affairs, to have a smoke control
system or systems shall have such systems designed in accordance with the applicable requirements of
Section 909 of this Code and the generally accepted and well established principles of engineering relevant
to the design. The construction documents shall include sufficient information and detail to describe
adequately the elements of the design necessary for the proper implementation of the smoke control
systems. These documents shall be accompanied with sufficient information and analysis to demonstrate
compliance with these provisions.”

16. Add a new section 909.2.1 to read as follows:

“909.2.1 Smoke Control. For the purposes of 909.2 the following publications shall be
considered as providing the generally accepted and well established principals of engineering relevant to
design of required smoke control systems.

(1) NFPA 92A, Standard for Smoke Control Systems Utilizing Barriers and Pressure Differences

(2) NFPA 92B, Standard for Smoke Management Systems in Malls, Atria, and Large Areas

(3) NFPA SPP-53, Smoke Control in Fire Safety Design

(4) ASHRAE/SFPE, Design of Smoke Management Systems

(5) ASHRAE, Guideline 5: Guideline for Commissioning Smoke Management Systems”

(6) NFPA 101, Life Safety Code (For non-mandatory guidance involving systems for existing
detention and correction facilities refer to A.23.3.1.3 of the 2000 Edition)

25



17. Add a new section 914.7.3 to read as follows:

“914.7.3 Limited Use Special Amusement Buildings: Special amusement buildings not open to

the public in excess of 45 days shall be permitted, provided all of the following conditions are met:

1. Portable fire extinguishers with a minimum of a 2A:10B:C rating are placed at each activity or
viewing station;

2. A smoke detection system is placed throughout the facility with a detector located at each
activity or viewing station and located throughout corridors and halls not to exceed a spacing
more than 15 feet (4.6 m) from a wall or more than 30 feet (9.1 m) on center;

3. Emergency lighting shall be provided which will cause illumination of the means of egress
upon activation of the fire alarm, any required smoke detector, or upon loss of power;

4. Personnel dedicated for the sole purpose of providing a fire watch shall be stationed at each
activity or viewing station. Such personnel shall be provided with a direct communication
device for communication with all other stations throughout the facility. In addition such
personnel shall be provided with appropriate training for the operation of portable fire
extinguishing equipment;

5. Communication to the responding fire department of emergency dispatch c